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He's the 800-pound gorilla of philanthropy, though he tips the scales at 165. The boards he consults with
raise unthinkable sums. And what is Jerold Panas's secret? It centers on helping boards adopt the right
approach, or rather, the right habits. In The Fundraising Habits of Supremely Successful Boards, Jerry
reveals how your board can raise surprisingly more money with a tweak here and there. Written specifically
for board members, and filled with stories that board members can relate to, Jerry knows how to inspire. He
should. He's motivated nearly 400 boards to raise literally billions of dollars. And the book takes only an
hour to read. If you've got a sluggish board, or one that's tentative, or one that simply needs guidance, have
them weigh in with Jerry. This gentle giant will bring out their best. Complements Panas' classic book,
Asking.
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From reader reviews:

Toby Terry:

The book The Fundraising Habits of Supremely Successful Boards: A 59-Minute Guide to Assuring Your
Organization's Future gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your
capable far more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem
along with your subject. If you can make reading a book The Fundraising Habits of Supremely Successful
Boards: A 59-Minute Guide to Assuring Your Organization's Future to get your habit, you can get much
more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You
can know everything if you like start and read a e-book The Fundraising Habits of Supremely Successful
Boards: A 59-Minute Guide to Assuring Your Organization's Future. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

David Hedges:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How many people to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specifically this The Fundraising Habits of
Supremely Successful Boards: A 59-Minute Guide to Assuring Your Organization's Future book since this
book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred percent guarantees there
is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Corinna Edwards:

Often the book The Fundraising Habits of Supremely Successful Boards: A 59-Minute Guide to Assuring
Your Organization's Future will bring one to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author
style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to read, this book very ideal to you. The
book The Fundraising Habits of Supremely Successful Boards: A 59-Minute Guide to Assuring Your
Organization's Future is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the
official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Aletha Bassett:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of several books in the top
collection in your reading list is The Fundraising Habits of Supremely Successful Boards: A 59-Minute
Guide to Assuring Your Organization's Future. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get
you closer in becoming precious person. By looking right up and review this book you can get many
advantages.
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