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This book is a practical guide toinventory management for wholesale distributors and stores that supply
"hardgoods".¿ It deals with merchandiseclassification and selection, forecasting, safety stocks,
replenishmentpurchasing, promotions, forward buying, stock adjustments, and supply chaintopics.It includes
many formulas andover 50 tables and charts that cover all areas of inventory management.¿ Industry data
and examples from the author'sauto parts distribution company and other automotive aftermarket
firmsillustrate each topic.¿¿ Many of theformulas are from IBM, JDA, and other inventory management
software packages,and are reprinted with their permission.¿All of these techniques were used to manage
inventories in the author'scompany for more than 20 years.The automotive aftermarket dealswith hundreds of
thousands of different items and a very high service levelrequirement, so these techniques should cover a
wide range of hard goodsdistribution.The book also has many anecdotesand case histories to illustrate the
key points.¿ It offers a valuable blend of strong, provenmathematical techniques and real life examples and
experiences.
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From reader reviews:

Terry White:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book INVENTORY MANAGEMENT AND
PURCHASING: TALES AND TECHNIQUES FROM THE AUTOMOTIVE AFTERMARKET. You can
choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of
book INVENTORY MANAGEMENT AND PURCHASING: TALES AND TECHNIQUES FROM THE
AUTOMOTIVE AFTERMARKET. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world
with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize everything! From your country
until eventually foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple issue until wonderful thing
you are able to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is
called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go through.

Alfred Stevens:

The publication untitled INVENTORY MANAGEMENT AND PURCHASING: TALES AND
TECHNIQUES FROM THE AUTOMOTIVE AFTERMARKET is the book that recommended to you to
learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you actually. The language that
publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of exploration
when write the book, so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could
possibly get the e-book of INVENTORY MANAGEMENT AND PURCHASING: TALES AND
TECHNIQUES FROM THE AUTOMOTIVE AFTERMARKET from the publisher to make you much more
enjoy free time.

Wendy Miller:

You will get this INVENTORY MANAGEMENT AND PURCHASING: TALES AND TECHNIQUES
FROM THE AUTOMOTIVE AFTERMARKET by visit the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this
reserve are various. Not only by means of written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book simply
by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for
you.

Curtis Graham:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book INVENTORY MANAGEMENT AND
PURCHASING: TALES AND TECHNIQUES FROM THE AUTOMOTIVE AFTERMARKET was
colourful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book INVENTORY MANAGEMENT
AND PURCHASING: TALES AND TECHNIQUES FROM THE AUTOMOTIVE AFTERMARKET has



many kinds or variety. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan
you can read and believe that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any
it offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like
reading that will.
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