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Public schools across the nation have turned to the criminal justice system as a gold standard of discipline.
As public schools and offices of justice have become collaborators in punishment, rates of African American
suspension and expulsion have soared, dropout rates have accelerated, and prison populations have exploded.
Nowhere, perhaps, has the War on Crime been more influential in broadening racialized academic and
socioeconomic disparity than in New Orleans, Louisiana, where in 2002 the criminal sheriff opened his own
public school at the Orleans Parish Prison. “The Prison School,” as locals called it, enrolled low-income
African American boys who had been removed from regular public schools because of nonviolent
disciplinary offenses, such as tardiness and insubordination. By examining this school in the local and
national context, Lizbet Simmons shows how young black males are in the liminal state of losing educational
affiliation while being caught in the net of correctional control. In The Prison School, she asks how schools
and prisons became so intertwined. What does this mean for students, communities, and a democratic
society? And how do we unravel the ties that bind the racialized realities of school failure and mass
incarceration?
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Owens:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is usually reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this The Prison School: Educational Inequality and School Discipline in
the Age of Mass Incarceration.

James Marcus:

In other case, little folks like to read book The Prison School: Educational Inequality and School Discipline
in the Age of Mass Incarceration. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Providing we
know about how is important a new book The Prison School: Educational Inequality and School Discipline
in the Age of Mass Incarceration. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by a
book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your country till foreign or
abroad you will find yourself known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you are able to know that.
In this era, we could open a book or maybe searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You should use it
when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Lloyd Schuler:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know
that that book is very important for us. The book The Prison School: Educational Inequality and School
Discipline in the Age of Mass Incarceration had been making you to know about other knowledge and of
course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-book The Prison School:
Educational Inequality and School Discipline in the Age of Mass Incarceration is not only giving you far
more new information but also to become your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your
current spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with all the book The Prison School:
Educational Inequality and School Discipline in the Age of Mass Incarceration. You never experience lose
out for everything in the event you read some books.

Cynthia Kipp:

The reserve with title The Prison School: Educational Inequality and School Discipline in the Age of Mass
Incarceration contains a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of advantage after read
this book. This specific book exist new know-how the information that exist in this e-book represented the
condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world.
This particular book will bring you within new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on your smart



phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.
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