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The compelling, inspiring, and comically sublime story of one man’s coming-of-age, set during the
twilight of apartheid and the tumultuous days of freedom that followed
 
Trevor Noah’s unlikely path from apartheid South Africa to the desk of The Daily Show began with a
criminal act: his birth. Trevor was born to a white Swiss father and a black Xhosa mother at a time when
such a union was punishable by five years in prison. Living proof of his parents’ indiscretion, Trevor was
kept mostly indoors for the earliest years of his life, bound by the extreme and often absurd measures his
mother took to hide him from a government that could, at any moment, steal him away. Finally liberated by
the end of South Africa’s tyrannical white rule, Trevor and his mother set forth on a grand adventure, living
openly and freely and embracing the opportunities won by a centuries-long struggle.
           
Born a Crime is the story of a mischievous young boy who grows into a restless young man as he struggles
to find himself in a world where he was never supposed to exist. It is also the story of that young man’s
relationship with his fearless, rebellious, and fervently religious mother—his teammate, a woman determined
to save her son from the cycle of poverty, violence, and abuse that would ultimately threaten her own life.
           
The stories collected here are by turns hilarious, dramatic, and deeply affecting. Whether subsisting on
caterpillars for dinner during hard times, being thrown from a moving car during an attempted kidnapping, or
just trying to survive the life-and-death pitfalls of dating in high school, Trevor illuminates his curious world
with an incisive wit and unflinching honesty. His stories weave together to form a moving and searingly
funny portrait of a boy making his way through a damaged world in a dangerous time, armed only with a
keen sense of humor and a mother’s unconventional, unconditional love.

Advance praise for Born a Crime

“[A] substantial collection of staggering personal essays . . . Incisive, funny, and vivid, these true tales are
anchored to his portrait of his courageous, rebellious, and religious mother who defied racially restrictive
laws to secure an education and a career for herself—and to have a child with a white Swiss/German even
though sex between whites and blacks was illegal. . . . [Trevor Noah’s] electrifying memoir sparkles with
funny stories . . . and his candid and compassionate essays deepen our perception of the complexities of race,
gender, and class.”—Booklist (starred review)
 
“A gritty memoir . . . studded with insight and provocative social criticism . . . with flashes of brilliant
storytelling and acute observations.”—Kirkus Reviews

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Monte Lawson:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for us
to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who
don't like reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem or
even exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Born a Crime: Stories from a South African Childhood.

Matthew Fry:

This Born a Crime: Stories from a South African Childhood are usually reliable for you who want to be a
successful person, why. The main reason of this Born a Crime: Stories from a South African Childhood can
be one of many great books you must have is giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you
actually with information that might be will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring
it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside that this
Born a Crime: Stories from a South African Childhood giving you an enormous of experience including rich
vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day exercise. So , let's
have it and luxuriate in reading.

Sarah Farmer:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Born a Crime: Stories from a South
African Childhood which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

Carolyn Lew:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Born a Crime: Stories from a South African
Childhood can be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are consequently out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
ebooks have than the others?
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