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You probably don't realize that your supermarket is filled with foods that have a military origin: canned
goods, packaged deli meats, TV dinners, cling wrap, energy bars . . . the list is almost endless. In fact, there's
a watered-down combat ration lurking in practically every bag, box, can, bottle, jar, and carton Americans
buy. Anastacia Marx de Salcedo shows how the Department of Defense Combat Feeding Directorate plans,
funds, and spreads the food science that enables it to produce cheap, imperishable rations. It works with an
immense network of university, government, and industry collaborators such as ADM, ConAgra, General
Mills, Hershey, Hormel, Mars, Nabisco, Reynolds, Smithfield, Swift, Tyson and Unilever. It's a good deal
for both sides: the conglomerates get exclusive patents or a headstart on the next breakthrough technology;
the Army ensures that it has commercial suppliers if it ever needs to manufacture millions of rations. And for
us consumers, who eat this food originally designed for soldiers on the battlefield? We're the guinea pigs in a
giant public health experiment, one in which science and technology, at the beck of the military, have taken
over our kitchens.
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From reader reviews:

David Pimentel:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Combat-Ready Kitchen: How the
U.S. Military Shapes the Way You Eat that give your fun preference will be satisfied through reading this
book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world far better
then how they react to the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man
or woman but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who want to start
looking at as your good habit, you can pick Combat-Ready Kitchen: How the U.S. Military Shapes the Way
You Eat become your own personal starter.

Sheri Reagan:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your limited time to read it because all this time you only find publication that need more time to
be read. Combat-Ready Kitchen: How the U.S. Military Shapes the Way You Eat can be your answer given
it can be read by a person who have those short spare time problems.

Dolores Parker:

The book untitled Combat-Ready Kitchen: How the U.S. Military Shapes the Way You Eat contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy approach. The language is very
clear and understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was
published by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of time of literary works. It is easy to
read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside
anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site in addition to
order it. Have a nice learn.

Veronica Shriner:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet.
Every year has been exactly added. This book Combat-Ready Kitchen: How the U.S. Military Shapes the
Way You Eat was filled in relation to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific
research competence. Some people has various feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big
good thing about a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to
get book which you wanted.
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