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WHO WAS SHE? 

In Regency London, a woman escapes from a burning warehouse only to realize she doesn't know her own
identity. Although the locket around her neck bears the name Miranda, she has no recollection of her past.
Nor does she know why two very different men want her—the devilishly handsome Scotsman Ian MacVane,
and Lord Lucas Chesney, the nobleman who claims to be her betrothed.  

In a race against time to discover who she is and which man she can trust, Miranda embarks on a soul-
stirring journey that takes her from the dazzling salons of London to the craggy Highlands of Scotland. All of
her beliefs—about herself, her world and the nature of love—are tested to their limits as she seeks the truth
about her past and finds an unexpected passion that ignites the hidden fires within….
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From reader reviews:

Harry Oliver:

The book Miranda can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you
want. Exactly why must we leave the good thing like a book Miranda? Wide variety you have a different
opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right
now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to give for each
other; you could share all of these. Book Miranda has simple shape however, you know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Major Talley:

The guide untitled Miranda is the book that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the
publication content that will be shown to you. The language that publisher use to explained their way of
doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of research when write the book, and so the
information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Miranda from the
publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Denise Wallis:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its cover may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer might be Miranda why because the great cover that make you consider
concerning the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or
maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Virginia Laird:

You may get this Miranda by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your
solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by
written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just
looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get
more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still
change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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