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The Edict of Nantes ended the civil wars of the Reformation in 1598 by making France a kingdom with two
religions. Catholics could worship anywhere, while Protestants had specific locations where they were
sanctioned to worship. Over the coming decades Protestants' religious freedom and civil privileges eroded
until the Revocation of the Edict of Nantes, issued under Louis XIV in 1685, criminalized their religion.

The Robillard de Champagné, a noble family, were among those facing the Revocation. They and their co-
religionists confronted the difficult decision whether to obey this new law and convert, feign conversion and
remain privately Protestant, or break the law and attempt to flee secretly in what was the first modern mass
migration. In this sweeping family saga, Carolyn Chappell Lougee narrates how the Champagné family's
persecution and Protestant devotion unsettled their economic advantages and social standing. The family
provides a window onto the choices that individuals and their kin had to make in these trying circumstances,
the agency of women within families, and the consequences of their choices. Lougee traces the lives of the
family members who escaped; the kin and community members who decided to stay, both complying with
and resisting the king's will; and those who resettled in Britain and Prussia, where they adapted culturally
and became influential members of society. She challenges the narrative Huguenots told over subsequent
generations about the deeper faith of those who opted for exile and the venal qualities of those who remained
in France.

A masterful and moving account of the Hugenots, Facing the Revocation offers a deeply personal
perspective on one of the greatest acts of religious intolerance in history.
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From reader reviews:

Flora Young:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yep,
by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to endure than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular Facing the Revocation: Huguenot
Families, Faith, and the King's Will book as beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is
usually more than just a book.

Elida Allman:

The experience that you get from Facing the Revocation: Huguenot Families, Faith, and the King's Will is a
more deep you searching the information that hide within the words the more you get interested in reading it.
It does not mean that this book is hard to know but Facing the Revocation: Huguenot Families, Faith, and the
King's Will giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in certain way that can
be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve is well-known enough.
This book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go
along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this specific Facing the
Revocation: Huguenot Families, Faith, and the King's Will instantly.

John Champlin:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This publication Facing the Revocation: Huguenot Families, Faith, and the King's Will was
filled about science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has different feel when they reading the book. If you know how big advantage of
a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that
you wanted.

Donald Vermillion:

That guide can make you to feel relax. That book Facing the Revocation: Huguenot Families, Faith, and the
King's Will was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Facing the
Revocation: Huguenot Families, Faith, and the King's Will has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on
there. Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and
relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading which.
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